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McGregor, Deanna M. 

From: Quinn, Charles N.

Sent: Wednesday, October 07, 2009 3:23 PM

To: McGregor, Deanna M.

Subject: FW: StonCor v. Les Pierres; our file 76110.42101
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Charles N. Quinn 
Attorney at Law 
Fox Rothschild LLP 
610-458-4984 - direct 
cquinn@foxrothschild.com  
  
 

From: Quinn, Charles N.  
Sent: Wednesday, October 07, 2009 3:02 PM 

To: 'James Menker' 

Subject: RE: StonCor v. Les Pierres; our file 76110.42101 

 
Your understanding is correct. 
  
Charles N. Quinn 
Attorney at Law 
Fox Rothschild LLP 
610-458-4984 - direct 
cquinn@foxrothschild.com  
  
 

From: James Menker [mailto:jmenker@holleymenker.com]  
Sent: Wednesday, October 07, 2009 2:19 PM 

To: Quinn, Charles N. 

Cc: McGregor, Deanna M.; Beebe, Carolyn P. 
Subject: RE: StonCor v. Les Pierres; our file 76110.42101 

 
Dear Mr. Quinn, 
  
Assuming my understanding is correct that you are asking for a 2 week extension only with respect to the 

service of the deposition transcript, I agree. 
  
Regards, 
James Menker 
  

  

 
Holley & Menker, P.A. 
PO Box 331937 (Mail) 



60 Ocean Boulevard, Suite 3 (Courier Only) 
Atlantic Beach, Florida 32233 
  
T:  904-247-2620 
T:  571-278-3366 
F:  202-280-1177 
  

From: Quinn, Charles N. [mailto:CQuinn@foxrothschild.com]  

Sent: Wednesday, October 07, 2009 1:50 PM 

To: James Menker 
Cc: McGregor, Deanna M.; Beebe, Carolyn P. 

Subject: StonCor v. Les Pierres; our file 76110.42101 
  
Dear Mr. Menker: 
  
The court reporter still has not delivered the transcript from Mr. Jewell's rebuttal deposition, with a signature page 
for his signature, to us. 
  
I would appreciate it if you would agree that we can have an additional two weeks to serve you with a signed and 
notarized copy of Mr. Jewell's testimony. 
  
Thank you for your consideration of this request. 
  
Charlie Quinn 
  
Charles N. Quinn 
Attorney at Law 
Fox Rothschild LLP 
Eagleview Corporate Center 
747 Constitution Drive 
Suite 100 
Exton, PA  19341 
610-458-4984 
610-458-7337 
cquinn@foxrothschild.com  

www.foxrothschild.com 
  
ATTENTION: 

  

IRS CIRCULAR 230 DISCLOSURE: 

Pursuant to Treasury Regulations, any tax advice contained in this communication 

(including any attachments) is not intended or written to be used, and cannot be 

used or relied upon by you or any other person, for the purpose of (i) avoiding 

penalties under the Internal Revenue Code, or (ii) promoting, marketing or 

recommending to another party any tax advice addressed herein. 

--------------------------------------------- 

This e-mail contains PRIVILEGED AND CONFIDENTIAL INFORMATION intended only for 

the use of the Individual(s) named above. If you are not the intended recipient  

of this e-mail, or the employee or agent responsible for delivering this to the  

intended recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination or copying 

of this e-mail is strictly prohibited. If you have received this e-mail in error, 

please immediately notify us by telephone at (215)-299-2167 or notify us by 

e-mail at helpdesk@foxrothschild.com.  Also, please mail a hardcopy of the e-mail 

to Fox Rothschild LLP, 2000 Market Street, Philadelphia PA 19103-3291 via the 

U.S. Postal Service.  We will reimburse you for all expenses incurred. 

  

Thank you. 
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